
DISABILITY BENEFIT: 
CONTROLLED OR UNDER-
CONTROLLED? 

Brenda Gannon∗

 In recent decades, as many economies endeavoured to reduce the 
numbers unemployed there was a notable increase in the receipt of 
social welfare disability payments. While the case of the Netherlands 
is an outstanding example of this trend, Ireland, among other 
countries, is no exception – official statistics show a steady rise in the 
number of applicants and recipients for disability payments over the 
late 1990s. The credibility of some of these recipients has been 
questioned (Public Accounts Committee (PAC), 2006). The core 
question addressed in this paper is if in fact the incidence of true 
disability has increased, or has mis-reporting of disability been 
spurred on by a perception of generous and easily accessible 
disability payments? The paper will also address the incentives for 
older workers to mis-report – this is of particular policy relevance, 
given the changing demographics of our society and the increasing 
focus on alleviating labour supply deficiencies via the employment of 
older workers. Expenditure on illness and disability amounted to 
approximately 14 per cent of total social welfare spending in 2004, 
over 1 per cent of GDP, so evidence of overpayments of disability 
welfare has some small but important budgetary implications. In 
many countries expenditure on disability payments reflects the rate 
of disability – the crucial question is does this high expenditure lead 
to mis-reporting of disability? If so, reporting behaviour and greater 
control of disability payments is an important concern to policy 
makers. 

1. 
Introduction

One of the main reasons for mis-reporting is the influence of 
economic incentive. If individuals think they could receive generous 
disability payments while out of work, they may be inclined to report 
a disability. In times of high employment levels, this could possibly 
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increase their chances of receiving social welfare. Within the 
economic literature, this is known as endogeneity of reported 
disability whereby individuals may mis-report the extent of a 
disability in order to rationalise labour force non-participation. If 
labour force groups behave in different ways depending on the 
financial incentives involved, this results in ‘systematic differential 
reporting’. Two groups likely to report systematically different to the 
employed, are the disabled/ill and retired.   

To examine the extent of mis-reporting of disability would 
require either an in-depth case study that monitors disability 
payment recipients, or a large scale econometric study that compares 
subjective reported disability to more objective measures of 
disability. Both of these methods have been used in the Netherlands 
and results indicate that there is a significant level of mis-reporting, 
and that this may be reduced by intensive monitoring of recipients. 
In the US and Spain, the main focus has been on comparing 
subjective and objective measures either by using administrative data 
or household survey data. Until recently in Ireland, there has been 
no research on the extent of mis-reporting. However, new evidence 
from a Public Accounts Committee report shows that there are in 
fact overpayments within the disability benefit schemes (2006). This 
small case study is supported by results from a more advanced 
econometric analysis that compares subjective and objective 
disability, (Gannon, 2006). The focus in this paper, therefore, is to 
review the results from these two studies and to discuss these in an 
international comparative context.  

The structure of the remainder of this paper is as follows. Section 
2 provides background data on disability prevalence and expenditure 
in the OECD, and potential reasons for mis-reporting in the context 
of the Irish labour market. Section 3 gives an overview of disability 
schemes in Ireland and the changing number of recipients over the 
years 1995-2004.  Evidence on mis-reporting in Ireland is given in 
Section 4. Results from International studies are compared in 
Section 5. Implications for policy in Ireland are discussed in Section 
6.  Conclusions are presented in Section 7. 
 
 
2.1  PREVALENCE OF DISABILITY IN OECD COUNTRIES 2. 

Background International comparisons of disability benefit expenditure and 
recipients ideally require a standard definition of disability across 
countries. Before assessing the prevalence of disability in various 
countries, we must acknowledge the lack of a common measurement 
of disability, and the fact that a common definition of disability is 
not easily attainable. In recent years, the classification of disability 
has received much attention and focus has shifted from the medical 
model of disability towards the social model of disability (World 
Health Organisation, 1999). The traditional medical form perceived 
individuals with disabilities as having an impairment that did not 
allow them to partake in mainstream social activities. Such 
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individuals were seen as inadequate and society did not 
accommodate them in ways to allow them to be actively included in 
daily societal activities. On the other hand, the social theory of 
disability stresses the discriminatory barriers in society whereby 
modifications should be made to include and accommodate the 
needs of all individuals. Disability is, therefore, an outcome of social 
attitudes/structures and the interaction between the person and 
environmental factors.  

The OECD have well recognised the limitations in comparing 
disability rates between member countries, but have successfully 
presented an overview of disability prevalence in the 1990s (OECD, 
2003). The OECD report used ECHP data from 1997 (see OECD, 
2003, Table 3.1), so in this paper we will update this information 
using the most recently available ECHP data from 2001. The 
definition employed in the OECD report aimed to address the 
World Health Organisation classification of disability, i.e. functional 
limitation or disability caused by a chronic illness or long-term 
impairment. To this end, responses to the self-reported question 
from the ECHP served as a useful starting point in European 
comparisons of disability prevalence. All individual respondents to 
the survey, aged 16 years and over, were asked “do you have any 
chronic physical or mental health problem, illness or disability?” and 
if so, “are you hampered in your daily activities by this chronic 
physical or mental health problem, illness or disability?” Individuals 
had a choice of three responses to this question, (1) “yes, severely” 
(2) “yes, to some extent” or (3) “no, not at all”. Table 1 presents the 
rate of disability for European countries, calculated from the 
responses severely or to some extent limited in daily activities. It 
presents rates for the age group 20-64 years to facilitate comparisons 
with other non-European countries, (see OECD, 2003). In over half 
of these countries, the rate of disability is greater than the European 
or OECD average. In particular, the rates in Sweden and the 
Netherlands are very high, compared to lower rates in more 
southern countries such as Spain or Portugal. The rate for Ireland is 
closer to the average. This table highlights the variation in disability 
rates across countries. Although, cross-country comparisons may be 
affected by survey design or definition of variables, we would not 
expect this to be a huge problem for the European countries in 
Table 1. Consequently, it leaves us to wonder if in fact differences 
across countries reflect variation in the disability welfare system.1  

 
 
 
 
 

1 In some countries the older age profile may contribute somewhat to a higher disability rate. 
There is also evidence of over-reporting in both Sweden and the Netherlands, (see Johansson 
and Skedinger, (2005) and Kerfhofs and Lindeboom (1995; 2002)). 
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Table 1: Prevalence of Disability, Age 20-64 Years 

 % 

Austria 11.8 

Belgium 11.0 

Canada 16.1 

Denmark 19.1 

France 16.4 

Ireland 12.8 

Italy 5.9 

The Netherlands 21.0 

Poland 14.5 

Portugal 16.2 

Spain 9.9 

Sweden 21.5 

UK 11.1 

US 16.5 

OECD 14.0 

EU 15.5 

Source: ECHP 2001 except for Canada (1998/1999), Poland (2000), US (1999). 
 
 

It is well documented that the prevalence of disability based on 
self-reporting may be biased and endogenous, that is individuals may 
mis-report the extent of their disability in order to rationalise labour 
force non-participation and receipt of disability benefits (Bound, 
1991). Therefore, it is not surprising to note that expenditure on 
disability benefits is highest in those countries with the highest rates 
of disability. Table 2 shows that the variation in disability prevalence 
is similar to that of government expenditure on disability payments. 
For example, in the Netherlands expenditure amounted to 2.6 per 
cent of GDP in 1999, compared to the EU average of 1.5 per cent. 
The percentage of total public social expenditure was 19 per cent, 
whereas the EU average was 11 per cent. Their disability rate was 
also high, over 20 per cent in 2001. More recently, in Ireland, 
expenditure on illness and disability amounted to approximately 14 
per cent of total social welfare spending in 2004, over 1 per cent of 
GDP. The corresponding disability rate was about 13 per cent.  At 
the other extreme, disability expenditure in Italy was less than 1 per 
cent, and only 7 per cent of total social expenditure – the disability 
rate was approximately 6 per cent. 
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Table 2: Disability Prevalence and Expenditure on Disability  

  % With Disability % of GDP % of Total 
Expenditure on 
Social Welfare 

Austria 11.8 1.75 8 

Belgium 11 1.06 7 

Canada 16.1 0.67 7 

Denmark 19.1 2.28 13 

France 16.4 0.83 6 

Ireland 12.8 1.2 14 

Italy 5.9 0.95 7 

The Netherlands 21 2.65 19 

Poland 14.5 3.28 20 

Portugal 16.2 1.03 8 

Spain 9.9 1.24 12 

Sweden 21.5 2.05 15 

UK 11.1 1.27 6 

US 16.5 0.71 10 

OECD 14 1.5 11 

EU 15.5 1.46 11 

 
The expenditure figures mirror the extent of disability across 

countries – countries with high expenditure have higher levels of 
disability. The direction of causation of this relationship is of crucial 
relevance to policy makers – preferably the generosity of payments is 
not causing increased levels of disability reporting. Hence, in Section 
4 we will probe further into this question, and focus in on disability 
reporting in Ireland. First though we look at potential theoretical 
reasons for mis-reporting. 

2.2  POTENTIAL REASONS FOR MIS-REPORTING 

The background to mis-reporting of disability and the relationship to 
labour market outcomes has been well documented in the literature. 
Bound (1991) and Lindeboom and Kerkhofs (2002) set out the main 
types of measurement error involved in estimating the effect of 
disability on labour force participation. First, there may be problems 
with the measurement of the disability variable and lack of 
comparability across individuals may lead to underestimates of the 
effect of disability (via classical measurement error). Second, 
economic (e.g. disability benefit) or psychological incentives may 
affect an individual’s response to questions on disability, leading to 
systematic reporting errors by different groups of individuals within 
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the self-reported measure of disability, i.e. differential measurement 
error.  

Labour market conditions and the structure of the social welfare 
system could well influence the amount of systematic reporting 
behaviour. More specifically, labour force participation changed 
dramatically in Ireland during the 1990s. The numbers in 
employment increased dramatically, and by 2001 there was almost 
full employment, leaving an unemployment rate of 3.6 per cent. For 
those who were still out of work, the eligibility rules for receiving 
unemployment assistance became more stringent, whereby 
unemployed persons must have proved they were actively seeking 
work to ensure continued receipt of unemployment assistance. The 
replacement rate – the ratio of unemployment benefits to after-tax 
wage income – was reduced from a high of 77 per cent to 64 per 
cent in 1994, a level below the OECD average. The Irish welfare 
system traditionally provided “…more or less permanent support for 
the unemployed” with no maximum duration for unemployment 
assistance. In recent years, however, recipients in some age groups 
have been required to register in a public employment or training 
programme if they wish to continue to receive benefits after their 
first six months on the rolls (Tille and Yi, 2001). 

During a cycle of full employment, individuals that do not wish 
to work may be required to seek an alternative explanation for their 
non-participation. Psychological and financial incentives may 
influence them to state that they are unable to work. Perhaps some 
individuals who do not want to work would claim to have a disability 
in order to (1) get disability social welfare assistance, or to (2) justify 
themselves for not working. The extent of these mis-reports could 
vary depending on whether the person is disabled/ill, unemployed or 
retired. Table 3 shows that there are differences in reported disability 
and associated limitations across labour force status categories in 
Ireland. At this stage we do not know if this is true disability or not, 
but none the less this provides a useful starting point to compare 
reported disability across labour force groups. 

Table 3: Labour Force Status by Restrictions in Daily Activities, 1995-2001,  
Age <65 Years 

 
Severe 

Restriction 
Some 

Restriction 
No 

Restriction 
No  

Disability N 

Employed 0.61 4.6 3.3 91.5 19,889 

Unemployed 1.59 9.18 2.75 86.5 2,069 

Disabled/ill 33.1 52.6 4.94 9.35 1,134 

Retired 9.47 23.08 8.28 59.17 845 

Self employed 1.04 6.93 3.76 88.27 2,497 

Other 2.02 9.52 4.22 84.25 14,132 

All 2.33 8.61 3.84 85.22 40,566 
Source: Calculations using Living In Ireland data 1995-2001. 
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For those who are employed there is a high proportion reporting 
no restriction or disability, as expected. Although 5 per cent are 
restricted in some way, we would not expect to see that employed 
workers would mis-report (Kreider, 1999) as there seems little 
incentive for them do so. Unemployed individuals on the other hand 
may be more likely to report a disability and we will need to 
disentangle whether this is true disability or mis-reporting with a 
view to obtaining disability allowance in the future. This may be 
difficult to do – it could be that due to lack of information they are 
claiming unemployment assistance rather than disability allowance, 
or it may be that they prefer to state their labour force status as 
unemployed rather than disabled, to avoid any potential 
discrimination. The disabled/ill group have a large proportion that 
say they are restricted in daily activities, as expected. About 14 per 
cent say that they are not restricted or have no disability. This is 
slightly higher than the figure presented for the Netherlands in 1993, 
where 11 per cent of those aged 58-63 years and in the labour force 
group of disabled, report no restrictions. The corresponding figures 
for the age groups 53-57 years and 43-52 years are 8 and 6 per cent 
respectively (Kerkhofs and Lindeboom, 1995). The 9.5 per cent of 
the labour force group ‘disabled/ill’ with no disability may be 
explained by the fact that their disability may be short term – our 
definition of disability means long-term chronic illness or disability 
only. 

Our hypothesis is that the disabled/ill group may over-report for 
financial and psychological reasons, but this could also be true for 
the retired group. Table 2 shows that almost one third report a 
limitation – we also hypothesise that this group over-reports their 
disability status. The next group are the self-employed and the 
expectation is that they have no incentive to mis-report – about 8 
per cent of them are restricted in some way. Finally, the other group 
include all those on training schemes or not covered by the previous 
categories. While these groups are not the focus of the paper, it will 
be interesting to view their disability reporting behaviour. 

This data clearly indicates different reporting behaviour by labour 
force groups, but the main question is whether this reflects true 
disability or whether economic incentives exist to influence 
differential reporting behaviour. The structure of disability schemes 
will most likely play a role in the reporting behaviour of the 
disabled/ill and retired groups. In the next section, therefore, we 
review some of these schemes. Furthermore, to understand why 
incentives may exist we will look at changes in participation on these 
schemes over the years. 
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 Disability schemes in Ireland are varied depending on whether or 
not the disability/illness is short term or long term, the extent of 
previous social insurance contributions and the cause of disability. 
Figure 1 illustrates a brief description. A report by the Department 
of Social and Family Affairs provides a more in-depth discussion of 
these payments and their historical context, (2003). To summarise 
disability payments may be categorised into short- and long-term 
payments, and entitlements also vary by previous social insurance 
contributions. The amounts received are comparable to 
unemployment assistance/benefit, so in that respect there is no 
incentive to prefer disability benefit. The incentive structure 
therefore lies in accessibility of these payments – if people think that 
disability payments are more readily available than unemployment 
payments, this may influence their disability reporting behaviour. 
Two main types of disability payments exist in Ireland – Disability 
Allowance is a weekly allowance paid to people with a disability who 
are aged 16 years or over and under age 66 years. The disability must 
be expected to last for at least one year and the allowance is subject 
to both a medical suitability and a means test. The Deciding Officer 
may refer an individual for a medical assessment. Disability Benefit is 
a payment made to insured people who are unable to work due to 
illness. For this payment, individuals must attend their own GP to 
get a medical certificate. They may be required to attend a further 
medical assessment within the department of Social Welfare, but this 
is at the discretion of the Deciding Officer. 

3. 
Review of 
Disability 

Schemes in 
Ireland

 
 
Figure 1: Description of Disability Payments in Ireland 
 
 

 

    Short-Term        Long-Term 

 

Injury Benefit                 OCCUPATIONAL INJURY                 Disablement Benefit 

Disability Benefit                                  OTHER DISABILITY            Invalidity Pension 

                                                        PRSI CONTRIBUTIONS 

 

                                                                   NO PRSI CONTRIBUTIONS 

 

         Disability Allowance 

                                  (Disabled Persons Maintenance Allowance, pre 1996) 
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Figure 2 shows that the proportion of the population in receipt 
of the main disability payments increased between 1995 and 2000. 
This could be a reflection of improved access and information to 
social welfare payments for people with disabilities (this could 
include those who were previously employed but now are aware of 
their entitlements). On the other hand, it could be that there has 
been mis-reporting of disability status. The proportions receiving 
benefit fluctuate for all age groups indicating that it is not just 
because individuals are getting more disabilities as they get older, but 
that there are other reasons for the fluctuation in the proportions 
getting these payments. 

Figure 2: Recipients of Disability Payments 1995-2004 
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Similar to the case of individuals who state their labour force 

status as unemployed, those who are near retirement age may also be 
prone to exaggerating their disability status, particularly if financial 
incentives exist. A pre-retirement allowance is available for 
individuals who have been unemployed for over a year and are aged 
55 years and over. The number of people in receipt of this payment 
dropped from about 15,000 in 1994 to approximately 11,000 in 
2004. For those who wish to ‘retire’ at an earlier age or were recently 
employed, social assistance is less available. Individuals must prove 
they are unable to find work, so in this case they may be more 
inclined to report a disability and apply for disability benefits. The 
health and retirement literature has focused on this issue for the US, 
UK and the Netherlands, but until recently there has been no 
comparable analysis for Ireland, possibly because of data limitations.  

If there were changes in monitoring of payments or institutional 
arrangements over the years, we might expect reporting behaviour to 
change. For example, in 1996 the administration of disability 
allowance was transferred to the Department of Social Welfare. 
Table 4 presents some administrative figures to support our proposal 
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that individuals may have changed their reporting behaviour over the 
period. The number of cases referred for medical assessment 
increased from 6,423 in 1997 to 10,285 in the year 2000, and 
consequently the number of applicants deemed as unqualified or 
who did not attend medical examination increased over the years. 
This could be the result of increased surveillance on this social 
welfare payment. It could also suggest that individuals were claiming 
they had a disability in an attempt to receive the Disability 
Allowance. The increasing number of cases referred for examination 
but then not qualifying could support this view. Second, for 
Disability Benefit the number of cases referred for examination also 
increased dramatically from 54,226 in 1995 to 63,927 in 1998. 
Higher proportions were found capable of work after 1998 – ranging 
from 11.8 per cent in 1998 to over 15 per cent after 2000. This 
suggests that individuals may have been over-reporting their 
disability status.  

Table 4: Percentage of Unqualified and Non-attendance to Medical Examinations 

 1995 1996 1997 1998 1999 2000 2001 2002 2003 2004 
Disability 
Allowance 

          

Cases referred 
for examination N/A N/A 6,423 7,229 8,862 10,285 9,663 8,952 8,450 NA 

Percentage 
Unqualified N/A N/A 28 32 30 28 31 31 32 NA 
Percentage 
Non-
attendance N/A N/A 25 26 27 33 32 30 27 NA 

           
Disability 
Benefit           

Cases referred 
for examination 54,226 52,059 55,089 63,927 59,224 45,037 41,710 42,017 38,670 35,505 

Percentage 
Capable of 
Work 14.8 12.8 13 11.8 12.5 15.6 15 14 16.6 16.3 

Percentage 
Non-
attendance 29 31.4 30.3 32.0 30.7 27.6 29.8 29.6 31.2 31.1 

Source: Statistical Information on Social Welfare Services, Department of Social, Community and Family Affairs. 
 

These figures imply that it may be of interest to determine if 
changes over time were due to mis-reporting and if this was 
influenced by any administrative or institutional changes in the 
system. So the next section discusses the studies that reveal the 
extent of reporting errors in Ireland. 
 
 Until recently in Ireland, there was no statistical evidence of 
overpayments of social welfare for disabilities. Two reviews have 
now been conducted and we discuss these in turn. The first is the 
Public Accounts Committee report, 2006. This report reviewed a 
pilot initiative of intensive monitoring of disability payments. The 
background to this evolved from a finding that lower back pain cases 

4. 
Evidence of 

Reporting Errors 
in Ireland
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represented 17 per cent of all disability benefit claims in 2002. 
Resources were then redirected to a pilot initiative that gave priority 
in medical examinations for these cases. As a result, many cases were 
found to be capable of working and the success of this initiative 
suggested that early intervention may be necessary for other 
ailments. Only 154 of the original 1,532 claimants qualified for 
disability benefit due to lower back pain. In terms of medical 
assessment, this report recommended that reassessment should take 
place – 16 claimants of disability allowance were reassessed in 2003 
and all were found not qualified, but we should bear in mind that 
they may qualify for other illness benefits under the social welfare 
system. For example in 2005, approximately 950 people found 
capable of work did not go back to work but availed of other 
schemes. Of course, some may not have been successful in getting 
employment so this is an issue that needs to be addressed.  

There are two plausible explanations for the large number found 
capable of working, (1) they may have been mis-reporting disability 
or (2) the large proportion found capable may be partially due to the 
backlog of medical examinations so that individuals have recovered 
by the time their medical examination took place. It is likely though 
that people found capable of working, then claimed other social 
welfare benefits – so even though overpayments had been made, the 
overall expenditure saving was minimal. None the less, the 
department of social welfare spends in excess of €23 million each 
year on fees to medical practitioners in respect of certificates and 
medical reports – whereas the total cost of medical assessment is 
about €3.6 million per year – the Public Accounts Committee 
believed that if the department had a process of reviewing 
certificates by GPs, particularly against the opinion of the 
subsequent medical assessments, then money could be saved. 

The second study is an econometric analysis of reporting 
behaviour between 1995 and 2001, (Gannon, 2006).2 The main 
question asked in that paper was “…does reported disability status 
depend on your labour force status”, i.e. was there state dependent 
reporting behaviour? The model employed in that paper compared 
subjective and objective measures of disability for each labour force 
status group, and any remaining effect of labour force status on 
reported disability (compared to the employed) was taken as 
evidence of state dependent mis-reporting. In other words, some 
financial incentives existed to influence individuals to report having a 
disability in order to rationalise their labour force status. In 
particular, the study found that compared to employed persons, mis-
reporting was clearly visible for those whose labour force status was 
disabled/ill or retired.  

The model is similar to that used by Kerfhofs and Lindeboom 
(1995). In their later paper (2002) however, they emphasised the 

2 Readers are referred to Gannon (2006) for a detailed account of the model. 
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importance of correcting for the fact that there may be unobserved 
individual characteristics such as previous investments in health or 
education that could influence labour force status and reported or 
true disability. Due to unobserved differences that exist between 
workers and disability recipients, they found that the extent of over-
reporting was less than previous. Similar to Lindeboom and 
Kerkhofs (2002), we allow for the influence of unobserved effects 
that may be correlated with the objective measure of disability and 
labour force status and find the same effect – the level of mis-
reporting is smaller. 

The results from this model are shown in Figure A1 and this 
compares the level of actual reported disability with predicted 
disability as if employed, for each labour force status group. This is 
described separately for each of the four levels of disability status.  
First, for the disabled/ill group under 30 per cent report having a 
severely limiting disability. When we predict how they would 
respond if they were employed, we find that only approximately 3 
per cent would report this type of disability. But unobserved 
individual characteristics should be accounted for, so we then find 
that about 15 per cent of the disabled/ill group would report a 
severely limiting disability. In other words, half of the original group 
would not report this limitation if responding as if employed. About 
55 per cent report some limitation, and this would reduce to about 
20 per cent when compared to the employed. So if the disabled/ill 
group are over-reporting severe or some limitations, it must be that 
they under-report no limitations or no disability. Indeed, the 
remaining two graphs show that over 4 per cent actually reported no 
limitations, when in fact almost double that would report in that 
manner if employed. The main difference, however, is for reporting 
of no disability – only 10 per cent report having no disability, but 
this increases to over 50 per cent when we account for measurement 
error relative to the employed. This graph clearly indicates that the 
disabled/ill group report severe or some limitations and under-
report having no disability. 

Similar to the case of individuals who state their labour force 
status as disabled/ill or unemployed, those who are near retirement 
age may also be prone to over-reporting their disability status. The 
model finds that the early retired group are prone to mis-reporting 
their disability status. This is evident from Figure A1 that shows 
about 10 per cent report severe limitations and this reduces to under 
5 per cent when compared to the employed. The extent of mis-
reporting of some limitations is similar – approximately 20 per cent 
report this level of disability, but only about 10 per cent are found to 
report this if employed. It is interesting to note also that unobserved 
effects do not play a huge role in this mis-reporting – this is an 
important finding indicating that the retired group are an easier 
target group for the elimination of reporting errors. In other words 
the reason for mis-reporting is purely financial and observed. There 
is also a small element of mis-reporting of no limitations – about 1 
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per cent report this type of disability compared to about 0.6 per cent 
if employed. Initially, we see that 60 per cent of the retired group 
report no disability and this increases to about 80 per cent if 
reporting as employed.  

In order to get some conclusive evidence on the extent of mis-
reporting of disability in Ireland, we should compare these results to 
the first study reported by the Public Accounts Committee and 
administrative data presented earlier in Table 4. First, for disability 
allowance if all those found unqualified or did not attend their 
assessment were actually mis-reporting disability, then the 
econometric result is consistent with administrative data i.e. 50 per 
cent do not report correctly. None the less, it is likely that some 
proportion is not mis-reporting and had recovered during the 
waiting time for assessment, so the econometric estimate may be 
higher than the actual level of mis-reporting. Similarly, for disability 
benefit, 40-45 per cent were found capable of work or non-
attendance. Conversely, the model predicts disability reporting 
compared to the employed, so if the employed were less likely to 
report a (true) disability, then the econometric estimate would 
actually be underestimated. As pointed out by Kerkhofs and 
Lindeboom (1995), in their model they do not need to determine 
who tells the truth – the overall aim is to get measure of disability 
that is cleansed of state-dependent reporting error. In this context, 
we must take into account other evidence in order to get a more 
absolute measure of mis-reporting, for example evidence of 
overpayments from the PAC report. Another reason that may lead 
us to suspect that the econometric figure is underestimated is that 
only approximately 10 per cent of those with back pain who were 
assessed were found incapable of working. There is still a question 
though if people with back pain are mis-reporting or not, but in 
Canada, Campoleiti (2006) found that more stringent screening of 
applications for disability insurance is associated with a decline in 
reports of back pain. While 90 per cent mis-reporting seems very 
high, an approximate level of 50 per cent seems more reasonable, 
but this would depend on the severity of the illness, length of 
waiting times for medical assessment and the type of illness 
involved. Finally, although some of the administrative data suggests 
that there may have been changes in reporting behaviour over time, 
the evidence from this study shows that there were only marginal 
changes in state dependent reporting between 1995 and 2001.  
 
 The findings from our study are quite similar to those found by 
Kerfhofs and Lindeboom (1995, 2002). In their 1995 paper they 
assess the magnitude of mis-reporting of self assessed health and 
find that about three-quarters of all individuals who state their 
labour force group as disabled/ill would not report bad or to some 
extent bad health, if they responded as employed. Although we 
measure mis-reporting of a slightly different variable, i.e. self 

5. 
 International 

Comparisons of 
Mis-reporting
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reported limitations, we find that about the same proportion of the 
disabled/ill labour force group would not report a severe or to some 
extent limiting disability/chronic illness, if responding as if 
employed. When we introduce unobserved effects into the model 
and control for the fact that mis-reporting may be due to some 
unobserved individual characteristics such as previous investments 
in health or education, we find the same result as Lindeboom and 
Kerkhofs (2002). These results are even more comparable because 
they focus on work limiting disability in their 2002 paper. Both 
models find that approximately 60 per cent of the disabled group 
over-report having a severe or to some extent limiting disability. This 
reduces the proportions in similar magnitudes, so the differences in 
the prevalence of disability across countries remain the same. If we 
suspect that differences in disability rates across countries are due to 
the presence of different social security systems, then we would 
expect that in the Netherlands there should be more mis-reporting 
than in Ireland. However, we have only discussed the differences 
within the disabled/ill group and we would need exact figures of 
actual reported disability across each labour force group, to precisely 
calculate differences across countries in the overall rate of reported 
disability. 

Our findings for the retired group are different to those from the 
Netherlands – we find that there is substantial mis-reporting among 
the retired. About one-fifth of those who report a disability would 
do so if they were employed. In the Netherlands, however, the level 
of reporting for the early retired group is quite similar to that of the 
employed. It is possible that differences in mis-reporting between 
the retired and disabled group arise in the Netherlands, because of 
different economic incentives for each group. Early retirement 
schemes were very popular in the 1980s and 1990s in the 
Netherlands as a means of encouraging people to leave the 
workforce to make room for a younger workforce. This means that 
older workers would not need to mis-report a disability in order to 
leave the workforce, as the direct retirement route was clearly 
possible. Given the changing demographics this is no longer 
necessary and the Dutch social partners have agreed that incentives 
for early retirement need to be reduced. Early retirement schemes 
are slowly being replaced by pre-pension arrangements shifting the 
burden of the cost from employers to the individual worker making 
the decision. Still, the OECD (2003) has reported that more needs to 
be done to reduce the incentives for early retirement. This may have 
implications for future mis-reporting of disability. In Ireland 
however, the incentives are similar for everyone up to age 66 years, 
so perhaps the retired group are simply a subset of the disabled/ill 
groups in terms of their reporting behaviour. Unless we analyse a 
harmonised dataset, we cannot precisely compare across different 
labour force groups, and even at that cultural and social norms will 
play a significant role in responses to similar questions. Kapteyn et al. 
(2004) found that for the same level of actual work disability, Dutch 
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respondents have a lower response threshold in claiming disability 
than American respondents. Their evidence shows that especially in 
the more subjective health problems of pain and emotion, 
Americans use a tougher standard when assigning work disability 
status. Why these differences exist is another question, to some 
extent it may be due to differences in social welfare and/or social 
norms. 

Once the evidence of mis-reporting is established, the next step 
in terms of policy is to try and reduce this reporting behaviour. In 
the Netherlands, this proved to be a difficult task and after many 
policy changes and pilot initiatives, the final outcome was to reduce 
the number of fraudulent disability insurance applications. In the 
Netherlands, around 10 per cent of the working age population were 
collecting benefits in the early 1990s. A major reform of the 
disability insurance scheme took place in 1993/1994 but there was 
no sustainable reduction in the numbers entering the scheme. Some 
of this may be attributed to a buoyant labour market whereby lower 
unemployment levels mean that individuals are more likely to aim 
for disability insurance schemes. In addition, they are less likely to 
loose their job when labour market conditions are good. More 
stringent measures were introduced in 2002 mainly because of 
institutional improvements3 and for the first time in seven years the 
total number of beneficiaries declined. Some of this decline may be 
cyclical (the Dutch economy was in a period of recession and inflow 
to unemployment insurance increased) but recent research shows 
that in fact intensified screening of sickness absence also reduces the 
number of disability insurance applications, (de Jong, Lindeboom 
and van der Klaauw (2006)). The current challenges facing the 
Netherlands now are to reassess the stock of existing beneficiaries, 
restrict full benefits to severe cases, and reduce access to partial 
benefits from people with mild disabilities that do not affect their 
daily functioning and work ability. 

In Spain, Jiminez-Martin et al. (2006) found that individuals aged 
between 55 and 59 years had a probability of receiving a benefit 
without deserving it, that was significantly higher than the rest of the 
individuals. Their results confirm that disability benefits are being 
used as a way of exiting the labour force before retirement age. 
While they do not specifically analyse the award errors for people 
aged less than 55 years, it is likely that this may also be a problem in 
Spain. One of the main sources of income for disabled persons is 
disability benefits, approximately 35 per cent receive benefits 
compared to an EU average of about 20 per cent, (OECD, 2003). 
Jiminez-Martin et al. (2006) make some recommendations for more 
medical tests but recognise the expenditure involved. But as we saw 
earlier the costs are likely to only be a small fraction of the benefits 

3 Stricter obligations on re-integration came into force in 2002 for employees on long-term 
sickness benefits. The five disability benefit agencies were merged reducing the influence of 
sector interests on the disability benefit authority. Penalties for firms became stronger. 
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(Netherlands). More recently, the Spanish Observatory of the Social 
Security System proposed reforms in the regulation of permanent 
disability benefits. These included approval of a list of occupational 
diseases and the exclusion of professions that are no longer suited to 
old-aged workers. In relation to this, they propose to modify 
retirement benefits by relaxing the restrictions on age for these 
professions. 

In the US, Gruber (2000) notes that the level of disability 
insurance is 42 per cent of previous earnings on average and mostly 
non-taxable. The author fears that this could be subsidising early 
retirement of older workers who have no other reason for retiring. 
Nonetheless, a replacement rate of 42 per cent is quite low 
compared to the Netherlands, and this could be a contributing factor 
to the higher rates of disability in the Netherlands compared to the 
US. There is also evidence of mis-reporting of disability status 
among older workers, although there are conflicting results between 
earlier and more recent studies. Kreider (1999) found that non- 
workers over-report work limitations. Their main focus was on the 
consequential econometric issues involved in labour force 
participation models, rather than the relationship between reporting 
and social security benefits for disabled people. Bound (1989) found 
that they were no dis-incentive effects of disability benefit – most 
people on disability insurance were found to be healthy and half of 
those who had been rejected for disability insurance were then found 
capable of work. This would suggest that in the US the level of 
benefits does not contribute to mis-reporting but more so that it is a 
favourable route towards retirement. Benitez et al. (2004) analysed 
the 45-64 year age group during the 1992-93 period and found that a 
person’s evaluation of health is similar to Social Security Award 
evaluation. Given that expenditure on disability benefits in the US is 
quite low at less than 1 per cent of GDP, and the fact that the 
disability rate is quite low, we should not expect a high level of mis-
reporting. Kreider (1999) and Benitez-Silva et al. (2004) give 
conflicting results but the earlier paper by Kreider only focuses on 
1992/93 whereas Benitez-Silva et al., focus on data up to 1996 – it is 
possible that the different results are due to cyclical variation. 
 
 There is clearly evidence of mis-reporting of disability and 
overpayments of disability welfare in Ireland, so the next step is to 
find a strategy that will fix this problem. The question is what type of 
policy reform is needed and to what extent this should be 
monitored. Policy reform, in terms of eligibility conditions, does not 
seem to be enough according to evidence from the Netherlands. The 
same level of mis-reporting can be observed in Ireland even though 
there was not much reform. In Ireland, the disability schemes are 
targeted towards a diverse group depending on severity and duration 
of illness/disability and there was little reform in terms of disability 
policy during the period 1995-2001. Benefits increased in line with 

6. 
Implications for 
Policy in Ireland
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other social welfare payments and there were very few institutional 
changes.  

In 1996 the payment of disability allowance was moved from the 
Department of Health to Social Community and Family Affairs. The 
purpose of this was to integrate income maintenance payments and 
to streamline the process for social welfare payments for the disabled 
more generally. The expectation was that this might reduce the level 
of potential overpayments within the system, nonetheless as we saw 
earlier the number of beneficiaries increased significantly but at the 
same time the level of mis-reporting only changed marginally. In 
2003, a report from the Department of Social Community and 
Family Affairs reviewed expenditure on illness and disability 
schemes. One of their main recommendations was to improve the 
effectiveness and efficiency of the system by introducing a simpler 
one. But more recently, the PAC reported on the level of 
overpayments within the system. The PAC report recognised the 
level of work that has been done to eliminate overpayments in the 
social welfare system but recommended that the Department of 
Social Welfare should introduce further systems of integration with 
the Revenue Commissioners in order to streamline systems and 
reduce time taken to detect overpayments. There should also be 
greater liaison between GPs certificates and medical assessments 
from the Department. While the level of overpayments may then be 
reduced it is likely however that individuals no longer entitled to 
disability payments will seek payment from another social welfare 
scheme – thus it is important that policy also ensures that individuals 
are re-integrated in to the labour market once they are capable of 
working. 

The implications from the more stringent measures in the 
Netherlands and the pilot initiative in Ireland are that this is a 
successful approach to reducing overpayments of disability welfare 
and ensuring that the appropriate people receive benefits. A cost-
benefit analysis by de Jong et al. (2006), shows that the costs of 
intensified screening are only a small fraction of the benefits. There 
is a strong case, therefore, for a similar cost-benefit analysis to be 
carried out in Ireland and additionally for a nationwide expansion of 
the pilot initiative. The lesson to be learned from the Netherlands is 
that reform of the schemes is not sufficient without effective 
monitoring. It is crucial, however, that reform does not affect those 
who are currently receiving disability payments if they are genuinely 
in need of assistance. An efficient monitoring system should 
appropriately distinguish between those in genuine need of social 
welfare and those who are mis-reporting or no longer incapable of 
work. 
 
 As disability prevalence increased in many OECD countries, this 
raised the question if in fact the incidence of true disability increased 
or was there an element of mis-reporting? It could be that financial 

7. 
Conclusion
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incentives existed to influence individuals to mis-report. This paper 
strived to answer this question using evidence from a recent Public 
Accounts Committee report and results from an econometric 
analysis of mis-reporting. The conclusion reached is that relative to 
the employed there was substantial mis-reporting in the late 1990s. 
Within the disabled/ill group almost 30 per cent had reported a 
severe disability, whereas this was reduced to approximately 15 per 
cent if individuals in this group would have responded as if 
employed. Similarly, the level of mis-reporting by the early retired 
group was reduced by half. These results are complemented by 
evidence from the PAC report that there was a substantial amount 
of overpayments in all social welfare in 2003, one-third of which 
were attributed to fraud. Some overpayments were due to the time 
lag in obtaining medical assessments, whereby some individuals had 
recovered and were then found capable of working. In this context, 
part of the econometric estimate may reflect mis-reporting due to 
this delay in medical assessment, rather than fraudulent mis-
reporting.  

These results are not unique to Ireland and this paper provided a 
comparative analysis with some other OECD countries. In terms of 
policy, the most effective strategy for reducing mis-reports is for 
careful monitoring of the disability benefit applicants. Evidence from 
the Netherlands suggests that this is a successful and inexpensive 
approach, and without effective monitoring, policy reform is not 
enough to reduce the number of overpayments of disability benefit. 
In an international context, these findings of overpayments are 
comparable to the Netherlands, Spain and the US.  The resulting 
question is; what type of policy reform is required to address this 
problem of overpayments of disability welfare? For example, in the 
Netherlands, policy reform without efficient monitoring did not lead 
to a change in reporting behaviour. Eventually, when stricter 
obligations and penalties for firms were introduced, the number of 
beneficiaries declined. It is crucial the solution does not affect those 
in genuine need of disability benefits. The emphasis should, 
therefore, be on improved medical assessments with shorter waiting 
times and efficient monitoring. In terms of government expenditure, 
international research has shown that the cost of monitoring is only 
a small fraction of benefits. 

The implications for Ireland are: 
� A need for review of the medical assessment procedure in order 

to reduce waiting times, and to reduce expenditure on medical 
practitioners. 

� Introduce further systems of integration between Department of 
Social Welfare and Revenue Commissioners in order to reduce 
time taken to detect overpayments. 

� Cost-benefit analysis of intensified screening should be carried 
out. 

� Effective monitoring of disability benefits is required, perhaps 
by making the pilot initiative a nationwide policy. 
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� Individuals found capable of work need to be re-integrated into 
the labour force, so as to reduce the number applying for other 
social welfare payments. 
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Figure A1  Actual v Predicted Probabilities –average of 1995-2001 
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